REGISTERED No.M.- 302
L.-7646

EXTRAORDINARY
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

ISLAMABAD, TUESDAY, NOVEMBER 21, 2023 _

PART II
Statutory Notifications (S. R. O.)

GOVERNMENT OF GILGIT-BALTISTAN
GILGIT-BALTISTAN PUBLIC PROCEUREMENT
REGULATORY AUTHORITY (GB PPRA)
(Finance Department)

NOTIFICATION

Gilgit, the 23rd August, 2023

S. R. 0. 1665(I)/2023—In exercise of powers conferred under Secion-26
of the Gilgit-Baltistan Public Procurement Act, 2021 the Government of Gilgit-Baltistan
is pleased to make the following amendments in Gilgit-Baltistan Public Procurement
Rules, 2022, namely:—

In the aforesaid Rules,—

(1) in Rule-15 (1) after the words procurement over the words “five
hundred thousand” shall be substituted with “one million”

(2) inRule-45,—
(@) in clause (a), for the words “one hundred thousand”, the words
“two hundred thousand” shall be substituted.

(b) in clause (b)(i), for the words “one hundred thousand”, the
words “two hundred thousand”, and for the words “five
hundred thousand” the words “one million” shall be
substituted.

[No.GB PPRA(Admin)-1/2022.]
FAISAL AHSAN PIRZADA,
Managing Director-GB PPRA.

(3513)

PRINTED BY THE MANAGER, PRINTING CORPORATION OF PAKISTAN PRESS, ISLAMABAD.
PUBLISHED BY THE DEPUTY CONTROLLER, STATIONERY AND FORMS, UNIVERSITY ROAD, KARACHL.

Price: Rs. 5.00

[2184(2023)/Ex. Gaz.]



